

April 3, 2017

The Walker Township Supervisors met on Monday, April 3, 2017 at the Walker Township Municipal Building for their monthly meeting. Martin Dreibelbis called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. Supervisors Casner and Wagner were present. The minutes of the March 6, 2017 meeting were approved as presented.

VISITORS: None present.

OLD BUSINESS: None reported.

ZONING: By motion of Mr. Dreibelbis, seconded by Mr. Wagner and carried it was resolved to approve the following permits as presented by Mrs. Shirley Saner: George Hazard for Buttonwood Campground (land use), Donald Delancy (land use), Zugstead Farm (land use), Tractor Supply Company (land use), Crist Peachey (land use), David Deamer (land use), Mifflintown Municipal Authority (land use), Treen Box & Pallet (land use), and Tammy Troutman/Justin Turnbaugh (land use).

SECRETARY: Attended the Supervisor and Rec Board meetings, meeting minutes, Payroll tax forms, Met with Auditors, Bid Ad, filed Salt contract, ordered salt, drove bid ad to Juniata Sentinel, copied all bids and mailed them.

ROADS: Kramer Tree Service took trees out along the upper part of Shirk Road.

ORDINANCES: None reported.

FINANCES: None presented.

PARK: Pavilions were started and underground electrical conduit is being run.

NEW BUSINESS: Bid were received from the following companies: **Materials:** Glenn O Hawbaker and New Enterprise Lime and Stone Co., **Equipment:** M&J Paving and Services and Steve Casner II. Bids were opened at 7:20 pm and were awarded on a line by line basis as follows:

Item	Awarded to	Bid Price FOB/Delivered
1500 T 2RC	Glenn O Hawbaker	7.00/14.01
600 T 2B	Glenn O Hawbaker	9.60/16.61
1000 T 1B	Glenn O Hawbaker	12.00/19.01
300 T 4	Glenn O Hawbaker	9.50/16.51
1500 T 2A Modified	Glenn O Hawbaker	7.80/14.81
100 T Limestone Sand	Glenn O Hawbaker	10.60/17.61
1000 T #8 washed	Glenn O Hawbaker	17.00/24.01
100 Ton Gabions	Glenn O Hawbaker	13.00/20.01
**This bid was approved by motion of Mr. Casner, seconded by Mr. Wagner and carried.		Without Operator/ With Operator
Front Loader 1 ¼ YD	M&J Paving	95.00/110.00
Backhoe ½ Yd	Casner II	68.00/No bid
Mini Backhoe 18 HP	Casner II	35.00/No Bid
Roller 10 to 14 Ton	M&J Paving	50.00/60.00
Tri-Axle Dump Truck 25 Ton	M&J Paving	No Bid/80.00
Laborer	M&J Paving	No Bid/40.00
Tri-axle trip rate to Walker: McAlisterville Quarry	M&J Paving	100.00
Milroy Quarry		145.00
Naginey Quarry		135.00
**These bids were approved by motion of Mr. Dreibelbis, seconded by Mr. Wagner. Mr. Casner abstained.		

SUBDIVISIONS: Deamer Trucking Corrective Action Plan (stormwater management plan) was reviewed. It was tabled until it goes through the Juniata County Planning Committee review.

BILLS: By motion of Mr. Casner, seconded by Mr. Wagner and carried it was resolved to approve the monthly bills paid with checks 12840 through 12869 and #665 from Mexico Street Light fund. An EFT for \$1,669.29 for payroll taxes was approved. Also, a transfer was made to the Fire Equipment Fund in the amount of \$7,354.35.

By motion of Mr. Wagner, seconded by Mr. Casner and carried it was resolved to adjourn at 8:00 pm.

Respectfully submitted,
Nancy Baillie, Secretary